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Saved By Seal is a non-profit organization dedicated to the conservation
and rehabilitation of seals and other marine animals. Founded in 2003, the
organization has grown into a leading force in marine conservation,
providing critical care to injured and orphaned seals, conducting research,
and advocating for policies that protect our oceans.

Mission and Vision
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Saved By Seal's mission is to promote the conservation and well-being of
seals and other marine animals, and to inspire the public to become
stewards of the marine environment. The organization's vision is a healthy
ocean where seals and other marine life can thrive.

History

Saved By Seal was founded in 2003 by Dr. Charles Innis, a veterinarian
and marine biologist who has dedicated his life to the care and protection of
marine animals. The organization began as a small rescue and
rehabilitation center in Maine, but has since expanded its reach to include
research, education, and advocacy programs.

Programs and Services

Saved By Seal offers a wide range of programs and services to protect and
care for seals and other marine animals. These include:

* Rescue and Rehabilitation: Saved By Seal operates a state-of-the-art
marine animal rehabilitation center where injured and orphaned seals are
treated and cared for. The center is staffed by a team of experienced
veterinarians and animal care specialists who provide expert medical care
and rehabilitation services. * Research: Saved By Seal conducts a variety
of research projects to better understand the health and ecology of seals
and other marine animals. This research helps the organization to develop
effective conservation strategies and inform policy decisions. * Education:
Saved By Seal offers a variety of educational programs and resources to
teach people about the importance of marine conservation. These
programs include school visits, public lectures, and online resources. *
Advocacy: Saved By Seal advocates for policies that protect seals and
other marine animals and their habitats. The organization works with



government agencies, businesses, and the public to raise awareness of
marine conservation issues and promote responsible stewardship of our
oceans.

Success Stories

Saved By Seal has a long history of success in rescuing, rehabilitating, and
releasing seals and other marine animals back into the wild. Some of the
organization's most notable success stories include:

* In 2005, Saved By Seal rescued a young seal pup named Hope who was
found entangled in fishing gear. Hope was successfully rehabilitated and
released back into the wild, and she has since given birth to several healthy
pups. * In 2010, Saved By Seal rescued a harbor seal named Storm who
was suffering from a severe infection. Storm underwent surgery and a long
course of antibiotics, and she made a full recovery. She was released back
into the wild in 2011, and she has been spotted several times since then. *
In 2015, Saved By Seal rescued a grey seal pup named Luna who was
found abandoned on a beach. Luna was malnourished and dehydrated, but
she was successfully rehabilitated and released back into the wild. She has
since been spotted several times, and she is now a healthy and thriving
adult seal.

How You Can Help

There are many ways that you can support Saved By Seal's mission to
protect seals and other marine animals. These include:

* Donate: Your financial support helps Saved By Seal continue its work of
rescuing, rehabilitating, and releasing seals and other marine animals. *
Volunteer: Saved By Seal relies on the help of volunteers to provide care



for the animals, assist with research, and educate the public about marine
conservation. * Adopt a Seal: You can adopt a seal through Saved By
Seal's Adopt-A-Seal program. This program helps to provide financial
support for the organization's rescue and rehabilitation efforts. * Spread
the Word: You can help Saved By Seal reach more people by sharing
information about the organization and its mission on social media and
other platforms.

Saved By Seal is a vital organization that is working to protect seals and
other marine animals and their habitats. The organization's dedicated staff
and volunteers are making a real difference in the lives of these animals,
and they are inspiring others to become stewards of our oceans. You can
support Saved By Seal's mission by donating, volunteering, adopting a
seal, or spreading the word about the organization's work.
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